
Bay Area Clean Water Agencies
Bid Results for Project 13-2023 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5%
Bid Due on February 23, 2023  4:00 PM (PDT)
REGIONAL BID AWARD

Section

SODIUM 
HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% 
In 275-gal totes 
(Optional bid item)

Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% In 
Drums (OPTIONAL BID ITEM)

SODIUM 
HYPOCHLORITE 
5.25% (Optional bid 
item)

Description Central Valley East Bay
Marin Sonoma 
Napa North Bay Peninsula Sacramento South Bay Tri Valley North Bay North Bay Sacramento

Unit of Measure gal gal gal gal gal gal gal gal gal gal gal
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc. $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Olin Corporation $3.09 $2.89 $2.99 $2.99 $3.05 $2.89 $3.09 $2.99 no bid no bid $1.50
Univar Solutions USA Inc. $3.50 $3.23 $3.25 $3.21 $3.28 $3.31 $3.25 $3.27 no bid no bid no bid
Hasa, Inc. $2.97 $2.85 $2.88 $2.81 $2.91 $2.94 $2.88 $2.69 $4.00 $4.00 $3.50

Lowest responsive bid for each region

Section

SODIUM 
HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% 
In 275-gal totes 
(Optional bid item)

Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% In 
Drums (OPTIONAL BID ITEM)

SODIUM 
HYPOCHLORITE 
5.25% (Optional bid 
item)

Description Central Valley East Bay
Marin Sonoma 
Napa North Bay Peninsula Sacramento South Bay Tri Valley North Bay North Bay Sacramento

Estimated annual quantity (in gals) 1,401,000 1,963,000 1,084,200 2,173,200 940,000 1,304,400 1,370,000 975,500 2,200 3,960 95,000
Olin Corporation $4,329,090.00 $5,673,070.00 $3,241,758.00 $6,497,868.00 $2,867,000.00 $3,769,716.00 $4,233,300.00 $2,916,745.00 no bid no bid $142,500.00
Univar Solutions USA Inc. $4,896,495.00 $6,337,349.20 $3,523,107.90 $6,982,056.96 $3,082,730.00 $4,322,651.16 $4,451,267.00 $3,194,274.75 no bid no bid no bid
Hasa, Inc. $4,156,626.90 $5,598,868.60 $3,126,832.80 $6,096,260.64 $2,736,904.00 $3,830,501.04 $3,951,354.00 $2,626,436.20 $8,800.00 $15,840.00 $332,500.00

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5%

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5%

Per Section 2.16 Method of Award
Bids may be awarded by the participating BACC agencies to the lowest, responsive, and responsible bidder for each listed region meeting the specifications for bulk loads for the chemical. The lowest responsive 
bidder for this chemical will be determined for each region listed on the Bid Form. The bidder that meets the specifications and submits the lowest overall bid price for a particular region may be awarded the bid by 
the participating agencies in that region, assuming the bid is determined by BACC to be complete and in compliance with the bid requirements.  The lowest overall bid price for each region will be determined by 
multiplying the estimated annual quantity for each participating agency within the particular region by the bid prices for the region, and adding up the aggregate cost.  BACC has the right to delete terms or options 
from the bid contract documents and reserves the right to reject any and all bids and to waive irregularities in said bids.
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