Bay Area Clean Water Agencies

Bid Results for Project 13-2024 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5%

Bid Due on February 22, 2024 4:00 PM (PDT)

REGIONAL BID AWARD

SODIUM
Sodium Hypochlorite |HYPOCHLORITE
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% In 12.5% In Carboys  |5.25% (Optional
Section SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% 275-gal totes (Optional bid item) | (OPTIONAL BID ITEM) |bid item)
Marin Sonoma
Description Central Valley East Bay Napa North Bay Peninsul; Sacr: ] South Bay Tri Valley Central Valley North Bay Marin Sonoma Napa Sacr
Unit of Measure gal gal gal gal gal gal gal gal gal gal gal gal
Hasa, Inc. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
JCl Jones Chemicals Inc. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Univar Solutions USA LLC. 3.2500 3.2300 3.2500 3.2100 3.2800 3.3100 3.2500 3.2700| no bid no bid no bid no bid
Olin Corporation 3.2900 3.3900 3.2900 3.2900 3.2900 3.2500 3.2900 3.2900|no bid no bid no bid 1.5000
Per Section 2.16 Method of Award
Bids may be awarded by the participating BACC agencies to the lowest, responsive, and responsible bidder for each listed region meeting the specifications for bulk loads for the chemical. The lowest responsive
bidder for this chemical will be determined for each region listed on the Bid Form. The bidder that meets the specifications and submits the lowest overall bid price for a particular region may be awarded the
bid by the participating agencies in that region, assuming the bid is determined by BACC to be complete and in compliance with the bid requirements. The lowest overall bid price for each region will be
determined by multiplying the estimated annual quantity for each participating agency within the particular region by the bid prices for the region, and adding up the aggregate cost. BACC has the right to
delete terms or options from the bid contract documents and reserves the right to reject any and all bids and to waive irregularities in said bids.
Lowest responsive bid for each region
SODIUM
Sodium Hypochlorite |HYPOCHLORITE
SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% In 12.5% In Carboys  |5.25% (Optional
Section SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% 275-gal totes (Optional bid item) | (OPTIONAL BID ITEM) |bid item)
Marin Sonoma
Description Central Valley East Bay Napa North Bay Peninsul; Sacr: ] South Bay Tri Valley Central Valley North Bay Marin Sonoma Napa Sacr
Estimated annual quantity (in gals) 1,954,818 1,855,000 1,078,000 2,115,000 885,000 1,149,900 1,310,000 990,700 2,750 2,000 16,000 95,000
|Univar Solutions USA LLC. $6,353,158.50| $5,991,650.00| $3,503,500.00 $6,789,150.00 $2,902,800.00( $3,806,169.00| $4,257,500.00| $3,239,589.00|no bid no bid no bid no bid
[olin Corporation $6,431,351.22| $6,288,450.00| $3,546,620.00| $6,958,350.00| $2,911,650.00| $3,737,175.00| $4,309,900.00 $3,259,403.00|no bid no bid no bid $142,500.00
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