
Bay Area Clean Water Agencies
Bid Results for Project 13-2021 SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5%
Issued on 03/18/2021
Bid Due on April 15, 2021  4:00 PM (PDT)
Exported on 04/15/2021

Section

SODIUM 
HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% 
In 275-gal totes 
(Optional bid item)

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5% 
In Drums (Optional bid item)

SODIUM 
HYPOCHLORITE 
5.25% (Optional bid 
item)

Description Central Valley East Bay
Marin Sonoma 
Napa North Bay Peninsula Sacramento South Bay Tri Valley North Bay Marin Sonoma Napa Sacramento

Unit of Measure gal gal gal gal gal gal gal gal gal gal gal
Univar Solutions USA Inc. $0.71240 $0.71550 $0.76910 $0.73660 $0.74600 $0.85880 $0.73770 $0.70150 no bid no bid no bid
Olin Corporation $0.78900 $0.70400 $0.77900 $0.73900 $0.73900 $0.75400 $0.76900 $0.70400 no bid no bid $0.66000

REGIONAL AWARD

12.5% In 275-gal totes 
(Optional bid item)

12.5% In Drums (Optional Bid 
Item)

 5.25%
(Optional Bid Item)

Central Valley East Bay
Marin Sonoma 

Napa North Bay Peninsula Sacramento South Bay Tri Valley North Bay Marin Sonoma Napa Sacramento
Estimated annual quantity (in gals) 1,549,000 1,989,000 1,035,000 2,194,000 1,620,500 1,082,400 1,400,000 1,125,000 2,200 1,700 85,000
Univar $1,103,507.60 $1,423,129.50 $796,018.50 $1,616,100.40 $1,208,893.00 $929,565.12 $1,032,780.00 $789,187.50 #VALUE! #VALUE! #VALUE!
Olin Chlor $1,222,161.00 $1,400,256.00 $806,265.00 $1,621,366.00 $1,197,549.50 $816,129.60 $1,076,600.00 $792,000.00 #VALUE! #VALUE! $56,100.00

*Highligted bid prices are only to show the apparent  low bid and should not be construed as any indication that BACC has accepted such bid as responsive; see bid review for award recommendation.

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5%

SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 12.5%

Per Section 2.16 Method of Award
Bids may be awarded by the participating BACC agencies to the lowest, responsive, and responsible bidder for each listed region  meeting the specifications for bulk loads for the chemical. The lowest 
responsive bidder for this chemical will be determined for each region listed on the Bid Form. The bidder that meets the specifications and submits the lowest overall bid price for a particular region may 
be awarded the bid by the participating agencies in that region, assuming the bid is determined by BACC to be complete and in compliance with the bid requirements.  The lowest overall bid price for 
each region  will be determined by multiplying the estimated annual quantity for each participating agency within the particular region by the bid prices for the region, and adding up the aggregate cost.  
BACC has the right to delete terms or options from the bid contract documents and reserves the right to reject any and all bids and to waive irregularities in said bids.
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