Bay Area Clean Water Agencies

Bid Results for Project 01-2022 ALUMINUM SULFATE
Issued on 01/27/2022

Bid Due on February 24, 2022 4:00 PM (PDT)
Exported on 02/24/2022

SINGLE BID AWARD

Section

Description

Unit of Measure

Univar Solutions USA Inc.
Chemtrade Chemicals, LLC US
Thatcher Company of California, Inc.

ALUMINUM SULFATE
2% Acidized Liquid
Solutions (Optional

ALUMINUM SULFATE 5% Acidized Liquid

ALUMINUM
SULFATE 7%
Acidized Liquid
Solution (Optional

ALUMINUM SULFATE 44%-49% Liquid Solution bid item) Solutions (Optional bid item) bid item)
North Bay |Sacramento |South Bay |Tri Valley South Bay South Bay |North Bay North Bay
gal gal gal gal gal gal gal gal
no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
0.8668 0.8668 0.8668 0.8668 1.1393 1.1250 1.0535 1.2192
1.0900 1.0900 1.1700 1.0900 0.0000 1.1600 1.2500 1.1800

*Highligted bid prices are only to show the apparent low bid and should not be construed as any indication that BACC has accepted such bid as responsive; see bid review for award recommendation.

Per Section 2.16 Method of Award

Bids may be awarded by the participating BACC agencies to the lowest, responsive, and responsible bidder meeting the specifications for bulk loads for the chemical. The lowest responsive bidder will be determined by multiplying the estimated annual
quantity for each participating BACC agency by the bid price for their region, and adding up the aggregate cost to all of the participating agencies in the regions. The single bid that results in the lowest overall cost to the participating agencies as a group
will be determined by BACC to be the low bid, assuming the bid is determined by BACC to be complete and in compliance with the bid requirements. BACC has the right to delete terms or options from the bid contract documents and reserves the right to
reject any and all bids and to waive irregularities of said bids.

Single Bid Award ALUMINUM SULFATE Optional Optional
44% - 49% Liquid Solution 2% Acidized Liquid 5% Acidized 7% Acidized
Unit Price Per Gallon Solutions (Optional Unit Price Per Gal Unit Price Per Gal
Aggregate Cost Calculation: North Bay Sacramento South Bay Tri Valley South Bay South Bay North Bay North Bay
Estimated annual quantity 2,235,900 1,228,000 20,000 790,000 1,680,000 1,680,000 150,000 150,000
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC $1,938,078.12 | $1,064,430.40 $17,336.00 $684,772.00 $1,914,024.00 $1,890,000.00 $158,025.00 $182,880.00
Thatcher Company of California, Inc. $2,437,131.00 | $1,338,520.00 $23,400.00 $861,100.00 no bid $1,948,800.00 $187,500.00 $177,000.00
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